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Introduction:
Pelvic lymph node dissection (PLND) is recommended while 
performing robot-assisted radical prostatectomy (RARP) for 
patients with localized intermediate or high-risk prostate 
cancer. However, symptomatic lymphoceles can occur after 
surgery in up to 15% of patients. 
Objectives:
Our objective is to describe a a novel Peritoneal Bladder 
Flap Bunching technique (PBFB) to reduce the risk of 
clinically significant lymphoceles in patients undergoing 
RARP and PLND.
Methods:
We evaluated 2,267 patients who underwent RARP with 
PLND, dividing them into two groups: Group 1, 567 patients 
who had the peritoneal flap (PBFB), and Group 2, 1,700 
patients without the flap, a propensity score matching done 
in a 1:3 ratio. Variables analyzed included estimated blood 
loss (EBL), operative time, postoperative complications, 
lymphocele formation and development of symptomatic 
lymphocele.
Results:
The two groups exhibited similar preoperative characteristics 
after matching in terms of age, prostate-specific antigen, 
body mass index, diabetes mellitus and preoperative AUA 
scores. There was no statistically significant difference in the 
occurrence of lymphoceles between the flap group and the 
non-flap group, with rates of 24 % and 20.9%, respectively 
(P=0.14). However, none of the patients in the flap group 
(0%) developed symptomatic lymphoceles, whereas 2.2% of 
patients in the non-flap group experienced symptomatic 
lymphoceles (P=0.01).

Conclusion:
The results demonstrate that prostate size reflects multiple 
outcomes, such as nerve-sparing, lymph node dissection, 
potency, oncological and pathological outcomes. We 
believe this data is valuable when counseling patients 
regarding possible outcomes before the procedure.


